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Introduction
The art of teaching reading comprehension has continually evolved, integrating various
methodologies to enhance students’ engagement and understanding. Among these, the SQ3R
method, an acronym for Survey, Question, Read, Recite, and Review, stands out for its structured
approach. This article delves into the application of SQ3R in English teaching and learning,
exploring its components, benefits, challenges, and practical implementation strategies for
educators.
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Overview of SQ3R

Survey

The Survey involves skimming the text to grasp the main ideas and structure. This preliminary scan
examines headings, subheadings, graphics, and summary paragraphs. It aims to provide readers
with a framework, helping them identify the primary themes and concepts before delving deeper
into the text. By familiarizing themselves with the content’s outline, students can set a purpose for
reading, which is crucial for comprehension.

Question

In the Question phase, students generate questions based on their survey. These questions, derived
from the headings and subheadings, guide their reading and help focus on key information. This step
promotes active engagement and critical thinking, as students anticipate the content and structure
of the material they are about to read. Generating questions stimulates curiosity and transforms the
reading activity from a passive reception of information to an active search for answers.
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Read

During the Read step, students read the text thoroughly, seeking answers to the questions they
formulated. This focused reading helps them concentrate on important details and enhances
comprehension by linking new information to their existing knowledge. Reading with specific
questions in mind helps students stay engaged and ensures that they are processing the information
at a deeper level.

Recite

The Recite step involves recalling and summarizing the main points and answers to the questions,
either orally or in writing. This process reinforces memory retention and ensures that students have
understood the material. By articulating their understanding, students solidify their grasp of the
content. Recitation encourages students to paraphrase information in their own words, which is a
powerful way to reinforce learning and ensure they have truly comprehended the material.

Review

Finally, in the Review phase, students revisit the material to reinforce their understanding and
retention. This step may include re-reading the text, reviewing notes, and answering additional
questions. It serves to consolidate learning and address any gaps in comprehension. Reviewing helps
transfer knowledge from short-term to long-term memory, ensuring that students retain the
information for future use.
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Benefits of SQ3R in English Teaching

Improved Comprehension

The SQ3R method aids students in breaking down complex texts into manageable parts, thereby
enhancing comprehension. By systematically surveying, questioning, reading, reciting, and
reviewing, students can better understand and retain information. This structured approach is
particularly beneficial for English language learners who often struggle with dense or unfamiliar
material (Kusumayanthi & Maulidi, 2019; Study.com, n.d.; Nebel, 2021). The method helps in
creating mental frameworks that make it easier to integrate new information.

Active Engagement

Generating questions and summarizing information encourages active engagement with the text.
This active involvement fosters critical thinking and analytical skills, as students must process and
interact with the content rather than passively reading it (Nebel, 2021; Kusumayanthi & Maulidi,
2019). Engaged readers are more likely to retain information and develop a deeper understanding of
the material.

Vocabulary Enrichment

The SQ3R method prompts students to focus on key terms and concepts, which can help expand
their vocabulary. As students encounter and engage with new words and phrases in context, their
vocabulary grows, a crucial aspect of language learning (Kusumayanthi & Maulidi, 2019).
Encountering words in context helps students understand nuances and usage, enhancing their

https://eflcafe.net/the-role-of-code-switching-in-efl-esl-classrooms-benefits-and-challenges/
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overall language proficiency.

Structured Learning

SQ3R provides a clear, step-by-step approach that helps students develop better study habits and
become more independent learners. This structured methodology can lead to improved academic
performance and a more disciplined approach to studying (Study.com, n.d.; Kusumayanthi &
Maulidi, 2019). The method encourages self-regulation, as students learn to take control of their
learning process.

Challenges and Considerations

Time-Consuming

One of the main challenges of implementing SQ3R is that it can be time-consuming, especially for
beginners who need more guidance and practice to master each step. Teachers must balance the
depth of engagement with the available time (Kusumayanthi & Maulidi, 2019). It is important to
scaffold the process and gradually reduce support as students become more proficient.

Initial Difficulty

Students may initially find it challenging to generate meaningful questions and summaries. This
difficulty can be mitigated by providing adequate support, examples, and practice opportunities.
Teachers should scaffold the process, gradually releasing responsibility to the students (Nebel,
2021; Kusumayanthi & Maulidi, 2019). Explicit instruction in question generation and
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summarization techniques can help students develop these skills.

Consistency

The effectiveness of SQ3R depends on consistent and correct application. Variations in how the
method is taught and used can impact its success. Teachers must ensure that they and their
students adhere to the method’s steps and principles consistently (Nebel, 2021). Regular monitoring
and feedback can help maintain consistency and fidelity to the method.

Practical Implementation Strategies

Teacher Training and Support

For SQ3R to be effective, teachers need proper training and support. Professional development
sessions focused on the method can equip teachers with the skills and knowledge necessary to
implement it successfully. Ongoing support, including workshops and peer observations, can also be
beneficial. Teachers should be encouraged to share best practices and resources to enhance the
implementation of SQ3R.

Scaffolded Instruction

Introducing SQ3R should be a gradual process, with teachers providing scaffolded instruction.
Initially, teachers can model each step, think aloud while demonstrating the process, and gradually
involve students in the practice. Over time, students can take on more responsibility, practicing the
method independently. Scaffolding helps build students’ confidence and competence in using the
method effectively.

Integration with Curriculum

SQ3R should be integrated into the curriculum rather than being used as an isolated strategy.
Teachers can incorporate it into various reading assignments and subjects, ensuring that students
apply the method consistently across different contexts. This integration helps students see the
value of the method and become more adept at using it. Curriculum alignment ensures that SQ3R
supports broader educational goals and learning outcomes.

Use of Technology

Technology can enhance the implementation of SQ3R. Digital tools, such as reading apps and online
resources, can support each step of the method. For instance, apps that allow for digital annotations
can help with the Survey and Question steps, while platforms that facilitate discussion and
collaboration can aid in the Recite and Review phases. Technology can also provide interactive and
multimedia resources that engage students and support their understanding.

https://eflcafe.net/parental-involvement-in-efl-esl-education/
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Addressing Common Challenges

Managing Time

To address the time-consuming nature of SQ3R, teachers can start with shorter texts and gradually
increase the length and complexity of the reading materials. They can also set specific time limits for
each step to ensure that the process does not become too lengthy. Time management strategies,
such as setting priorities and breaking tasks into smaller segments, can help streamline the process.

Supporting Question Generation

Teachers can support students in generating meaningful questions by providing question stems and
examples. Encouraging students to use Bloom’s Taxonomy as a guide can help them formulate
higher-order questions that promote deeper understanding. Question prompts can be tailored to
different levels of Bloom’s Taxonomy, guiding students from basic recall to more complex analysis
and synthesis.

Ensuring Consistency

To ensure consistency in applying SQ3R, teachers can create checklists or rubrics that outline the
steps and criteria for each phase. Regular feedback and reflection sessions can help students stay on
track and refine their use of the method. Teachers can also use formative assessments to monitor
progress and provide targeted support where needed.

Enhancing Vocabulary and Comprehension

Vocabulary Development

The SQ3R method enhances vocabulary development by encouraging students to focus on key terms
and concepts during the Survey and Read steps. Teachers can further support vocabulary
acquisition by providing word lists, glossaries, and context-based activities. Engaging students in
discussions about word meanings and usage can deepen their understanding and retention of new
vocabulary.

https://eflcafe.net/effective-use-of-storybooks-in-efl-esl-teaching/
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Comprehension Strategies

In addition to the structured steps of SQ3R, teachers can integrate other comprehension strategies
to support students’ understanding. These strategies may include graphic organizers, mind
mapping, and summarization techniques. By combining SQ3R with other effective reading
strategies, teachers can create a comprehensive approach to reading instruction.

Promoting Independent Learning

Self-Monitoring

SQ3R fosters self-monitoring and metacognitive awareness, as students are required to plan,
monitor, and evaluate their reading process. Teachers can encourage self-monitoring by providing
reflection prompts and guiding students in setting personal learning goals. Metacognitive strategies
help students become more aware of their learning processes and develop strategies for overcoming
challenges.

Encouraging Autonomy

By teaching students to use SQ3R independently, educators can promote autonomy and lifelong
learning skills. Encouraging students to apply SQ3R to their personal reading and study habits can
help them become more self-directed learners. Autonomy in learning empowers students to take
charge of their education and develop skills that are transferable to other areas of their lives.

https://eflcafe.net/effective-communication-in-english-essential-skills-for-efl-esl-learners/
https://eflcafe.net/effective-communication-in-english-essential-skills-for-efl-esl-learners/
https://eflcafe.net/promoting-student-autonomy-in-language-learning/
https://eflcafe.net/promoting-student-autonomy-in-language-learning/


Use of SQ3R in English Teaching and Learning

eflcafe.net AUTHOR: EFLCafe / TITLE: Use of SQ3R in English Teaching and Learning | 8

Case Studies and Examples

Implementation in the Classroom

Although this article does not include specific case studies, it is worth noting how SQ3R has been
successfully implemented in various classroom settings. Teachers have reported improvements in
students’ reading comprehension, engagement, and retention when using SQ3R. Examples from
classrooms around the world demonstrate the versatility and effectiveness of the method in diverse
educational contexts.

Adapting for Different Learners

SQ3R can be adapted to meet the needs of different learners, including those with varying
proficiency levels and learning styles. For instance, English language learners may benefit from
additional support and modified texts, while advanced students can use SQ3R to tackle more
complex material. Teachers should consider individual differences and provide differentiated
instruction to ensure that all students benefit from the method.

Conclusion
The SQ3R method offers a valuable framework for enhancing reading comprehension and overall
language proficiency in English teaching and learning. Its structured approach and emphasis on
active engagement make it an effective tool for educators. While challenges exist, particularly
regarding the time required and initial difficulty, these can be mitigated through careful planning,
scaffolded instruction, and consistent application. By leveraging the benefits of SQ3R and
addressing its challenges, teachers can significantly enhance their students’ reading comprehension
and independent learning skills.

Educators are encouraged to explore the use of SQ3R in their classrooms, adapt it to their specific
contexts, and continuously reflect on its effectiveness. With commitment and thoughtful
implementation, SQ3R can transform students’ reading experiences and contribute to their
academic success.
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